COLUMBIA COUNTY
ARPA-Huousing Rehab Program

i NE Hernando Ave. Lake City, FL 32055
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Contractor Grand Bid Total Grand Bid Total Grand Bid Total Grand Bid Total Grand Bid Total Grand Bid Total
Lewis Bros, Inc No Bid $45,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $38,536.00
DSW Homes $75,950.00 $29,400.00 $32,000.00 $25,400.00 $17,400.00 $23,000.00
Patriot Response Group $35,840.00 $43.725.00 $39,250.00 $25,996.00 $23,780.00 $19,090.00
PROJECT COST ESTIMATE $35,000.00 $32,000.00 $35,000.00 - $30,000.00 $25,000.00 $20,000.00
Al%ﬂﬂmm%:liﬂﬁls% below cost estimate ALF4{40.250) 71151 1{29,750.} A15%{36,200) A173{27,200.) .Mwuo,.zsd) I-.i:';_(zg;rso.) Alﬁ“;—d,smhl'-v(zs,sooj 415%{28.750) $115121,250) £15%(23,000} £ 157 (17,000)

Low Bid: Patriot Response Group DSW Homes DSW Homes DSW Homes DSW Homes Patriot Response Group
Recommended Bid: Patriot:535,840.00 DSW:29,400.00 DSW:32,0600.00 DSW:25,400.00 Patriot:$23,780.00 Patriot:S19,090.00
COMMENTS:

All bids were el d and found Bid award are made 1n with the CDBG HAP Policy Section H: Bidding pgs. 37-39.
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